
SKU# Items to license COUNT Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

2UJ-00003    DsktpEdu ALNG LicSAPk MVL ECAL 
2500 (FTE 
Count for 
Faculty)

 $         53.63  $     134,075.00  $         54.22  $     135,550.00  $           53.61  $            134,025.00 

9EA-00039 WinSvrDataCtr ALNG LicSAPk MVL 2Lic CoreLic 144  $         36.18  $         5,209.92  $         36.58  $         5,267.52  $           36.16  $                5,207.04 
7JQ-00341 SQLSvrEntCore ALNG LicSAPk MVL 2Lic CoreLic  78  $    1,077.90  $       84,076.20  $    1,089.69  $       84,995.82  $      1,077.45  $              84,041.10 
9EP-00037 SysCtrDatactrCore ALNG LicSAPk MVL 2Lic CoreLic  144  $         23.61  $         3,399.84  $         23.88  $         3,438.72  $           23.60  $                3,398.40 
395-02412 ExchgSvrEnt ALNG LicSAPk MVL 3  $       317.58  $            952.74  $       321.05  $            963.15  $         317.44  $                   952.32 
H04-00232 SharePointSvr ALNG LicSAPk MVL   1  $       424.71  $            424.71  $       429.36  $            429.36  $         424.54  $                   424.54 
M6K-00001 Office 365Edu ShrdSvr ALNG SubsVL MVL PerUsr 18000  $               -    $                   -    $               -    $                    -    $                 -    $                          -   
5XS-00003 Office 365ProPlusEdu ALNG SubsVL MVL AddOn to OPP 18000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
2ZA-00002 MinecraftEdu ALNG SubsVL MVL PerUsr 10  $           4.42  $              44.20  $           4.56  $              45.60  $             4.42  $                     44.20 
2ZA-00002 MinecraftEdu ALNG SubsVL MVL PerUsr 100  $           4.42  $            442.00  $           4.56  $            456.00  $             4.42  $                   442.00 

Total of  What to License 228,624.61$     231,146.17$     228,534.60$            

Items removed from Bid
Dyn365ForCustmrSrvc ALNG LicSAPk MVL DvcCAL Campus 3 92  $       17,679.64  $       17,873.76  $              17,672.28 
Dyn365ForTeamMembers ALNG LicSAPk MVL DvcCAl Campus 3 2500  $       38,400.00  $       38,825.00  $              38,375.00 
AzureActvDrctryPremP1A ShrdSvr ALNG SubsVL MVL PerUsr 18000  $       41,940.00  $       43,200.00  $              41,940.00 
AzureActvDrctryPremP1A ShrdSvr ALNG SubsVL MVL PerUsr 2500  $       14,550.00  $       14,700.00  $              14,525.00 
Totals with everything on bid 341,194.25$     345,744.93$     341,046.88$            

Note: Scholar Buys did not meet specifications due to not being K12 LAR Partners
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